


Nestled within National Gallery Singapore, YÀN is a 
character-rich venue designed with versatility in mind. 
From subtle hues of soft beiges and gentle taupes that 
adorn the walls to floor-to-ceiling windows that 
provide copious natural light by day, YÀN is a wonderful 
collision of elegance and old-school charm. 
 
Linger at our plush, intimate tables and nosh on
chef-forward menus that highlight classic Cantonese 
cuisine; all layered to perfection. From tables and linens 
to customisable lunch and dinners heavy on house-
crafted favorites, we’ve got you covered.
 
Combining personalized service and detail-oriented 
Cantonese classics, get hitched as you’ve always 
imagined - timeless and romantic.



Combining old-world charm with modern amenities, 
your love story finds its perfect setting at YÀN. Every 
element of YÀN's expansive 2,700 sq-ft space is 
meticulously designed, weaving an atmosphere of 
grandeur and intimacy that sets the stage for your 
unforgettable day.
 
The cozy booth seats provide a snug haven where 
you and your guests can revel in togetherness. 
Alternatively, YÀN's spacious tables and 3 private 
dining rooms, meticulously designed for larger 
gatherings, provide ample space for mingling and 
creating a vibrant atmosphere of celebration that 
echoes through the venue. 
 
With a capacity to comfortably host 120 guests, YÀN's 
space is perfect find for those envisioning a grandeur 
affair. 











 
ADDRESS

#05-02 National Gallery Singapore 1 St Andrew's 
Road, Singapore 178957 

 
PARKING

Available at the National Gallery Singapore 
 

FLOOR SPACE
2,700 square feet 

 
SEATING CAPACITY

120 pax, 3 private rooms 
 

WRITE TO US: 
reserve@yan.com.sg 

www.yan.com.sg


